Updated:
Sale Date

01/09/19
01/09/19

01/09/19
01/09/19
01/09/19
01/09/19

01/09/19
01/09/19
01/09/19
01/09/19

01/09/19
01/09/19
01/09/19
01/09/19
01/09/19
01/09/19
01/09/19

01/09/19
01/09/19
01/09/19
01/09/19

01/16/19
01/16/19
01/16/19
01/16/19
01/16/19

01/16/19
01/16/19
01/16/19
01/16/19
01/16/19
01/16/19

Updated:

02/04/20

1:07:10PM

Case Number

09CV160540
14CV184972

15CV187169
17CV192062
17CV192960
17CV193028

17CV193175
17CV193882
17TX006872
18CV194964

18CV195337
18CV195402
18CV195449
18CV195612
18TX007000
18TX007037
18TX007042

18TX007053
18TX007059
18TX007083
18TX007086

14CV185070
16CV190597
17CV191949
17CV194126
18CV194250

18CV194739
18CV194828
18CV194851
18CV195127
18CV195169
18CV195171

02/04/20

Lorain County Sheriff's Office

475 East College Street Oberlin, Oh 44074
3830 Lorain Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055

12457 Eaton Boulevard Grafton, Oh 44044
12376 Melody Lane Grafton, Oh 44044
3450 Crehore Street Lorain, Oh 44052

321 Colorado Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052

38579 East River Road Elyria, Oh 44035
415 Palomino Court Lagrange, Oh 44050
2072 East 28Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052
42361 Wilbur Street Elyria, Oh 44035

2161 Elyria Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052

8951 West Ridge Road Elyria, Oh 4403501(1Unit D

3869 Gregus Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055

116 Courtland Street Elyria, Oh 44035

Vacant Lot Located At The Northwesterly Corner Of Middle Avenue Elyria Ohi
9884 West River Road Columbia Station, Oh 44028

255 Roosevelt Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

1804 West 29Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052

2413 East 29Th Street Lorain, Oh 44055

2330 East 31St Street Lorain, Oh 44055

Vacant Lot 120" X 180" Located At The Northwest Corner Of Forestlawn Shet

1125 West 19Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052

32689 Redwood Boulevard Avon Lake, Oh 44012
4390 Jaycox Road Avon, Oh 44011

44677 Bursley Road Wellington, Oh 44090

93 Pike Court Lagrange, Oh 44050

38363 West Royalton Road Grafton, Oh 44044
50966 Portman Road Amherst, Oh 44001

3331 Elyria Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055

1108 West 18Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052
32254 Electric Boulevard Avon Lake, Oh 44012
140 East Lake Court Lagrange, Oh 44050
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Appraisal Amount

$120,000.00
$63,000.00

$39,000.00
$57,000.00
$66,000.00

$75,000.00
$9,000.00

$69,000.00

$27,000.00
$51,000.00
$33,000.00
$63,000.00

$210,000.00
$171,000.00
$99,000.00
$45,000.00

$120,000.00
$147,000.00
$21,000.00
$21,000.00
$105,000.00
$57,000.00

Sale Price
Cancelled
Cancelled
$41,040.00
$38,000.00
$44,000.00
No Bid
$85,120.00
No Bid
No Bid
Cancelled
$18,000.00
$34,000.00
$32,300.00
$42,000.00
No Bid
$24,000.00
No Bid
$31,985.90
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$180,000.00
Cancelled
$66,000.00
No Bid
$118,900.00
$98,000.00
$14,000.00
$14,000.00
Cancelled
$38,000.00

09-00-087-107-015
03-00-101-116-023
03-00-101-116-024
03-00-101-116-025
11-00-036-113-019
11-00-036-104-020
03-00-057-111-018
02-01-002-108-007
02-01-002-108-008
02-01-002-108-009
02-01-002-108-010
10-00-006-106-022
15-00-098-108-112
03-00-094-101-010
06-21-005-105-006,
06-21-005-105-005
02-00-093-105-006
06-24-002-701-020
03-00-099-115-004
06-24-026-105-015
10-00-003-119-031
12-00-040-101-018
06-25-017-107-013
06-25-017-107-014
02-02-017-116-017
03-00-082-105-004
03-00-082-104-008
03-00-041-117-032,
03-00-041-117-33,
03-00-041-117-34,
03-00-041-117-35,
03-00-041-117-36
02-01-006-140-010
04-00-018-182-001
04-00-024-101-096
21-12-000-000-017
15-00-099-102-078,
15-00-099-102-109
11-00-096-000-031
01-00-077-000-042
03-00-098-127-003
02-01-006-133-028
04-00-019-112-051
15-00-099-102-104



Sale Date

01/16/19
01/16/19
01/16/19
01/16/19
01/16/19
01/16/19
01/16/19

01/16/19
01/16/19
01/16/19
01/16/19
01/16/19
01/23/19

01/23/19

01/23/19
01/23/19
01/23/19
01/23/19
01/23/19
01/23/19
01/23/19
01/23/19
01/23/19
01/23/19
01/23/19
01/23/19
01/23/19
01/23/19
01/23/19
01/23/19
02/13/19
02/13/19
02/13/19
02/13/19
02/13/19
02/13/19
02/13/19
02/13/19
02/13/19
02/13/19

Updated:

Case Number

18CV195339
18CV195360
18CV195657
18CV196022
18TX007043
18TX007070
18TX007078

18TX007079

18TX007089-108-031
18TX007089-110-01€
18TX007089-112-037

18TX007099
17CV193930

18CV194412

18CV194548
18CV195245
18CV195814
18CV195844
18TX007027
18TX007041
18TX007049
18TX007061
18TX007074-038
18TX007074-044
18TX007081
18TX007096-020
18TX007096-021
18TX007096-040
18TX007101
18TX007116
09CV160985
14CV183463
15CV186434
17CV192301
17CV192836
17CV193303
17CV193917
17CV194083
18CV194385
18CV194632

02/04/20

Lorain County Sheriff's Office

2609 Goble Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055

617 South Logan Street Elyria, Oh 44035

200 Jones Street Wellington, Oh 44090

1771-1773 East 37Th Street Lorain, Oh 44055

12435 Avalon Drive Grafton, Oh 44044

1602 Washington Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052

1820, 1820 1/2, 1822, 1822 1/2 And 1832 Long Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052

819 West 17Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052

1917 East 29Th Street Lorain, Oh 44055
1756 East 30Th Street Lorain, Oh 44055
1749 East 33Rd Street Lorain, Oh 44055
141 Fuller Road Elyria, Oh 44035

5150 Longbrook Road Lorain, Oh 44053

530 Hazelwood Drive Vermilion, Oh 44089

5278 Mills Creek Lane North Ridgeville, Oh 44039
743 North Abbe Road Elyria, Oh 44035

5934 Rosebelle Avenue North Ridgeville, Oh 44039
837 West 23Rd Street Lorain, Oh 44052

1838 Oberlin Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052

218 Chestnut Street Elyria, Oh 44035

A Vacant Lot Located At The Southeasterly Corner Of Rush Street, Elyria Oh
1621 West 20Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052

835 F Street Lorain, Oh 44052

4207 Belle Avenue Sheffield Lake, Oh 44054

264 West 38Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052

1214 West 6Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052

1210 West 6Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052

128 Roosevelt Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

1780 East 32Nd Street Lorain, Oh 44055

1020 West 10Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052

4720 Chelsea Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055

133 Ashland Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

2810 North West River Road Elyria, Oh 44035

129 West Street Wellington, Oh 44090

33700 Henwill Road Columbia Station, Oh 44028
942 West 29Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052

36120 Chestnut Ridge Road North Ridgeville, Oh 44039
39372 Chestnut Ridge Road Elyria, Oh 44035

684 Regina Drive Vermilion, Oh 44089

1733-1735 East 30Th Street Lorain, Oh 44055
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Appraisal Amount

$48,000.00
$51,000.00
$75,000.00
$33,000.00

$186,000.00

$33,000.00

$162,000.00
$57,000.00
$81,000.00
$45,000.00

$144,000.00
$36,000.00
$60,000.00
$63,000.00
$51,000.00
$123,000.00
$180,000.00
$90,000.00
$39,000.00

Sale Price
$32,000.00
$47,500.00
$77,520.00
$23,850.00

Cancelled
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$8,747.60
Cancelled
$52,000.00

Cancelled $162,000.00

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Cancelled

No Bid
No Bid

Cancelled

Cancelled

Cancelled

$106,500.00
$75,000.00
$30,000.00

$12,099.27
$39,000.00

$32,000.00

$24,000.00
$40,000.00

$36,000.00
$110,092.00

$102,600.00
$26,000.00

03-00-078-108-007
06-25-006-119-024
18-00-028-102-027
03-00-101-106-016
11-00-036-114-022
02-01-006-132-018
02-01-006-139-046,
02-01-006-139-047
02-01-006-135-029
03-00-095-108-031
03-00-096-110-016
03-00-096-112-037
10-00-004-129-041
02-03-006-102-019,
02-03-006-102-020,
02-03-006-102-008
01-00-004-117-003,
01-00-004-117-004
07-00-007-130-070
06-25-028-101-002
07-00-020-114-038
02-01-006-159-003
02-02-025-114-043
06-26-056-000-001
06-24-085-104-001
02-02-025-118-027
02-01-003-112-038
03-00-029-101-044
02-01-003-258-014
02-02-026-108-020
02-02-026-108-021
06-25-017-109-040
03-00-096-112-021
02-01-005-119-018
03-00-077-106-054
10-00-005-101-165
06-22-014-102-004
18-00-028-109-010
11-00-009-102-056
02-01-006-167-014
07-00-025-101-018
10-00-005-101-392
01-00-004-120-037
03-00-096-109-039



Sale Date
02/13/19

02/13/19
02/13/19
02/13/19
02/13/19
02/13/19
02/13/19
02/13/19
02/13/19

02/13/19
02/13/19
02/13/19
02/13/19
02/13/19
02/13/19
02/13/19
02/27/19
02/27/19
02/27/19
02/27/19

02/27/19
02/27/19

02/27/19
02/27/19
02/27/19

02/27/19
02/27/19
02/27/19
02/27/19

02/27/19
02/27/19
02/27/19
02/27/19
02/27/19

Updated:

Case Number

18CV194649

18CV194753
18CV194782
18CV194910
18CV194933
18CV195008
18CV195138
18CV195615
18CV196160

18TX006987-017
18TX006987-029
18TX006987-032
18TX006987-038
18TX006987-040

18TX006997
18TX007033
16CV190023
17CV191407
17CV192188
17CV192696

17CV192907
17CV193042

17CV193850
17CV194019
17TX006966

18CV194950
18CV195154
18CV195493
18CV195503

18CV195658
18CV195947
18CV196037
18TX007003
18TX007054

02/04/20

Lorain County Sheriff's Office
330 Stable Drive Lagrange, Oh 44050

254 Marseilles Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

175 Crestview Drive Elyria, Oh 44035

3259 Regina Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052

31957 Grove Street Avon Lake, Oh 44012
4043 Woodstock Drive Lorain, Oh 44053

312 Cambridge Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

411 Pemberton Drive Elyria, Oh 44035

38428 Otten Road North Ridgeville, Oh 44039

Vacant Lot Located On The Westerly Side Of Superior Avenue 120 Feet Sout
Vacant Lot Located On The Northerly Side Of E 33Rd St And Located Directly
Vacant Lot Located On The Northwest Corner Of E 34Th St And Dallas Ave L
Vacant Lot 40.02' X 115.90' X 114.71' Located On The Northwest Corner Of E
Vacant Lot Located On The Northerly Side Of Helen St Elyria Ohio 44035 Anc
Vacant Lot Located On The Northwest Corner Of East Dr And South Ave She
102 Harvard Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

4680 Erhart Drive Lorain, Oh 44053

5401 Frances Drive Lorain, Oh 44053

7180 Deer Run Drive Amherst, Oh 44001

202 Haigh Road Kipton, Oh 44049

9627 Patricia Court Elyria, Oh 44035
4126 Forestlawn Avenue Sheffield Lake, Oh 44054

4113 Talbot Lane Lorain, Oh 44055
3713 Falbo Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052
131 Warden Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

4418 Charles Drive Lorain, Oh 44053

31819 Cook Road North Ridgeville, Oh 44039
22961 Hawley Road Wellington, Oh 44090
5001 Elyria Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055

221 Kentucky Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052

941 Livermore Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

21 South Cedar Street Oberlin, Oh 44074

Vacant Lot Adjacent To 1364 E Erie Ave Lorain, Oh 44052
6210 South Broadway Lorain, Oh 44053
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Appraisal Amount

$63,000.00
$168,000.00
$111,000.00
$201,000.00
$108,000.00

$99,000.00
$165,000.00
$153,000.00

$174,000.00
$120,000.00
$150,000.00

$60,000.00

$126,000.00
$99,000.00

$54,000.00
$120,000.00

$90,000.00
$111,000.00
$210,000.00
$69,000.00

$42,000.00
$72,000.00
$150,000.00

Sale Price

No Bid

Cancelled
Cancelled

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
Cancelled

Cancelled
Cancelled
No Bid

Cancelled

Cancelled

Cancelled

No Bid

$17,106.84
$51,000.00

$112,000.00
$74,000.00

$66,000.00
$135,000.00
$112,870.13

$140,000.00

$32,400.00

$85,000.00

$38,000.00
$80,000.00

$80,850.00
$74,000.00
$46,000.00
$35,000.00
$50,000.00

$141,000.00

$41,148.54

15-00-098-106-048,
15-00-098-106-049
06-25-019-108-042
06-23-025-104-013
02-01-006-187-001
04-00-030-141-036
02-02-021-118-017
06-25-074-102-005
10-00-005-107-485
07-00-041-000-008,
07-00-041-000-027,
07-00-041-000-033
03-00-110-109-017
03-00-098-125-029
03-00-098-128-032
03-00-098-120-038
06-22-018-103-040
03-00-043-114-070
06-25-005-101-020
02-02-010-000-426
02-02-005-107-037
05-00-057-000-102
13-11-016-101-040,
13-11-016-103-001,
13-11-016-103-002,
13-11-016-103-004,
13-11-016-103-006
10-00-001-102-076
03-00-029-101-006,
03-00-029-101-007,
03-00-029-101-008
03-00-079-122-003
02-01-003-244-020
06-24-035-103-011
06-24-035-103-010
02-02-011-000-145
07-00-003-102-044
18-00-010-000-010
03-00-112-103-005
03-00-111-103-003
02-00-051-107-013
06-25-027-104-011
09-00-085-107-005
02-00-051-105-011
06-21-001-101-031



Sale Date

02/27/19
02/27/19
02/27/19
02/27/19

03/13/19
03/13/19
03/13/19
03/13/19
03/13/19
03/13/19
03/13/19
03/13/19
03/13/19
03/13/19
03/13/19
03/27/19

03/27/19
03/27/19
03/27/19
03/27/19
03/27/19
03/27/19
03/27/19

03/27/19
03/27/19
03/27/19

03/27/19

03/27/19
03/27/19
03/27/19
03/27/19
03/27/19
03/27/19
03/27/19
03/27/19
03/27/19

Updated:

Case Number

18TX007058
18TX007066
18TX007153
18TX007154

14CV184002
16CV190333
16CV190519
17CV192726
18CV194274
18CV194404
18CV195033
18CV195056
18CV195575
18TX007104
18TX007152
14CV183013

16CV189658
17CV191608
17CV192450
17CV193768
17CV193818
17CV193820
17TX006956

18CV194953
18CV195504
18CV195701

18CV195850

18CV196076
18CV196147
18CV196187
18CV196470
18TX007009-005
18TX007009-023
18TX007030
18TX007039
18TX007047

02/04/20

Lorain County Sheriff's Office

Vacant Lot Located On The Westerly Side Of East Drive, Sheffield Lake Oh 4
821 Rosewood Drive Elyria, Oh 44035

A Vacant Lot Located Directly Between 4203 Elyria Avenue And 4211 Elyria A
4500 E. Hamilton St., Oberlin, Oh 44074 And Adjacent Vacant Land Directly V

181 Inwood Boulevard Avon Lake, Oh 44012

38020 Edge Meadow Court, North Ridgeville Oh 44039
2633 West 38Th Street Lorain, Oh 44053

306 Bon Air Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

23628 Redfern Road Columbia Station, Oh 44028
2336 East 32Nd Street Lorain, Oh 44055

191 Grafton Street Oberlin, Oh 44074

5204 Birch Street North Ridgeville, Oh 44039

133 Crown Hill Amherst, Oh 44001

1972 East 29Th Street Lorain, Oh 44055

A Vacant Lot Located On The Southwest Corner Of E Prospect Street And Ct
7387 Dyke Avenue North Ridgeville, Oh 44039

7359 Denny Drive North Ridgeville, Oh 44039

518 Willow Park Elyria, Oh 44035

41530 State Route 18 Wellington, Oh 44090

947 Osborne Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052

5449 Hawthorne Avenue Sheffield Lake, Oh 44054

209 West 23Rd Street Lorain, Oh 44052

Vacant Land Located On Roosevelt Avenue Being Located 172.12 Feet Souti

717 Stanford Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035
442-446 Washington Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052
3652 Lake Road Sheffield Lake, Oh 44054

737 Hollywood Avenue Sheffield Lake, Oh 44054

828 Fairwood Boulevard Elyria, Oh 44035

826 South Logan Street Elyria, Oh 44035

338 West 31St Street Lorain, Oh 44055

237 Stanford Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

Vacant Lot Located Directly Between 1120 Lake Avenue And 1108 Lake Aven
Vacant Lot Located On The Northwest Corner Of Shear Street And Lake Aver
1214 West 14Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052

Vacant Lot Located On The Northerly Side Of Cooper Foster Park Road Betw
330 West 28Th Street Lorain, Oh 44055
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Appraisal Amount

$90,000.00
$180,000.00
$96,000.00
$69,000.00
$141,000.00
$75,000.00
$75,000.00
$111,000.00
$75,000.00

$60,000.00
$66,000.00
$144,000.00
$87,000.00
$75,000.00
$24,000.00

$69,000.00
$33,000.00
$84,000.00

$126,000.00

$81,000.00
$51,000.00
$33,000.00
$72,000.00

Sale Price

No Bid
$46,500.00
No Bid
Cancelled

$126,000.00
Cancelled
Cancelled
$46,000.00
$94,000.00
Cancelled
$65,000.00
$134,400.00
$50,000.00
No Bid
No Bid
Cancelled

$75,000.00

Cancelled
$208,757.00

Cancelled
$56,000.00
No Bid $2,000.00

No Bid

Cancelled
$30,439.53
$56,000.00

$100,000.00

$65,000.00
$42,000.00
$32,000.00
$55,000.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Cancelled
No Bid

03-00-043-114-056
06-23-030-106-006
03-00-108-113-002
09-00-097-000-041,
09-00-097-000-040
04-00-018-108-020
07-00-042-101-107
02-02-013-107-002
06-25-022-105-044
12-00-020-123-004
03-00-081-101-010
09-00-096-110-012
07-00-018-101-150
05-00-024-110-015
03-00-095-109-019
15-00-046-103-007
07-00-046-104-005,
07-00-046-104-009
07-00-015-106-005
06-24-028-106-005
19-04-003-000-008
02-02-027-116-008
03-00-032-102-007
02-01-003-179-005
07-00-007-109-006
07-00-007-109-007
07-00-007-109-008
07-00-007-109-009
07-00-007-109-010
06-25-002-102-030
02-01-005-105-005
03-00-044-102-037
03-00-044-102-038
03-00-044-102-039
03-00-039-118-011
03-00-039-118-012
06-25-028-102-028
06-25-006-128-007
02-01-003-209-015
06-25-004-102-012
06-24-027-109-005
06-24-085-104-023
02-02-025-103-016
05-00-099-000-093
02-01-003-193-013



Sale Date

03/27/19
03/27/19

03/27/19

03/27/19
03/27/19
03/27/19
03/27/19
03/27/19
03/27/19

03/27/19
03/27/19
04/10/19
04/10/19

04/10/19
04/10/19
04/10/19
04/10/19

04/10/19
04/10/19
04/10/19
04/10/19

04/10/19
04/10/19
04/10/19
04/10/19
04/10/19
04/10/19
04/10/19
04/10/19
04/10/19
04/10/19
04/10/19
04/10/19
04/24/19
04/24/19
04/24/19
04/24/19
04/24/19

Updated:

Case Number

18TX007065
18TX007068

18TX007090

18TX007095-002
18TX007095-008
18TX007095-009
18TX007095-013
18TX007095-036
18TX007103

18TX007108
18TX007122
17CV191311
17CV193293

18CV194334
18CV194424
18CV194907
18CV194964

18CV195064
18CV195165
18CV195394
18CV195463

18CV195855
18CV195901
18CV196185
18CV196280
18CV196373
18TX007077
18TX007127
18TX007129
18TX007134
18TX007135
18TX007145
18TX007161
09CV160540
09CV163926
12CV176459
12CV177716-003
12CV177716-006

02/04/20

Lorain County Sheriff's Office

1604 West 23Rd Street Lorain, Oh 44052
Two Vacant Lots 90' X 105' Located On The Westerly Side Of Liberty Avenue

Two Vacant Lots Located On The South Side Of West 21St Street, Lorain, OF

701 West River Road And 701 West River Road Rear Elyria, Oh 44035
114 Irondale Street Elyria, Oh 44035

117 Morgan Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

338 17Th Street Elyria, Oh 44035

121 1/2 Morgan Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

4113 Elyria Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055

5129 Rolling Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055

1516 New Mexico Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052
195 Beachwood Avenue Avon Lake, Oh 44012
207 Lakewood Drive Avon Lake, Oh 44012

305 Falling Water Circle Amherst, Oh 44001
106 Hope Court Elyria, Oh 44035

127 Bellfield Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035
42361 Wilbur Street Elyria, Oh 44035

17555 Quarry Road Wellington, Oh 44090

Vacant Land Formerly Known As 1225 West Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035
138 Pasadena Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

429 Aldrich Road Vermilion, Oh 44089

23732 Royalton Road Columbia Station, Oh 44028

932 West 22Nd Street Lorain, Oh 44052

321 Oxford Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

227 Harwood Street Elyria, Oh 44035

916 Walnut Street Elyria, Oh 44035

1047 West 17Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052

318 West 25Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052

2213 East 32Nd Street Lorain, Oh 44055

Vacant Lot Located Directly Northwest Of 131 Lake Ave., Elyria, Oh 44035
3442 Reid Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055

Vacant Lot Approximately 22' X 154.50' Located Directly Southwest Of 215 W
Vacant Lot Located Directly Between 215 14Th Street And 211 14Th Street E
475 East College Street Oberlin, Oh 44074

409 South Main Street Wellington, Oh 44090

151 Butternut Drive Amherst, Oh 44001

1119 Oberlin Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052

2117 East 29Th Street Lorain, Oh 44055
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Appraisal Amount

$174,000.00
$60,000.00

$225,000.00
$90,000.00
$60,000.00
$69,000.00

$111,000.00
$9,000.00
$72,000.00
$54,000.00

$147,000.00
$33,000.00
$75,000.00
$75,000.00
$54,000.00

$141,000.00
$120,000.00
$111,000.00

Sale Price
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$8,178.44
No Bid
$14,500.00
No Bid
No Bid $9,301.63
No Bid
$13,500.00
Cancelled
Cancelled
Cancelled
$60,000.00
No Bid $22,500.00
Cancelled
$76,000.00
$6,000.00
$81,000.00
$50,036.00
$98,000.00
$50,000.00
$50,000.00
$44,526.03
No Bid
No Bid
$8,973.86
No Bid $17,728.59
$14,995.89
No Bid
No Bid
Cancelled
Cancelled
Cancelled
$29,000.00

02-02-016-101-018
03-00-076-104-024,
03-00-076-104-025
02-02-022-107-004,
02-02-022-107-005
06-24-141-000-002
06-24-010-105-008
06-24-035-106-009
10-00-003-117-013
06-24-035-106-036
03-00-103-123-
006,03-00-103-123-
016
03-00-111-112-002
03-00-056-116-013
04-00-007-129-003
04-00-030-130-016
04-00-030-130-017
05-00-005-106-032
10-00-004-126-003
06-25-018-107-014
06-21-005-105-006,
06-21-005-105-005
14-00-092-000-005
06-26-008-102-015
06-25-017-108-015
01-00-002-105-036
01-00-002-105-105
12-00-016-000-061
02-01-006-150-018
06-25-075-103-005
06-25-035-109-037
06-24-083-101-004
02-01-006-134-010
02-01-003-178-013
03-00-094-111-014
06-26-094-103-001
02-01-003-233-013
02-01-003-140-032
06-26-006-102-028
09-00-087-107-015
18-00-022-108-048
05-00-043-104-001
02-01-006-119-003
03-00-094-104-006



Sale Date

04/24/19
04/24/19
04/24/19
04/24/19

04/24/19
04/24/19
04/24/19
04/24/19
04/24/19
04/24/19
04/24/19
04/24/19
04/24/19

04/24/19
04/24/19
04/24/19
04/24/19
04/24/19
04/24/19
04/24/19
04/24/19
04/24/19
04/24/19
04/24/19
04/24/19
05/08/19
05/08/19
05/08/19
05/08/19

05/08/19
05/08/19
05/08/19
05/08/19
05/08/19

05/08/19
05/08/19
05/08/19
05/08/19
05/08/19
05/08/19

Updated:

Case Number

12CV177716-068
14CV183463

17CV193393-005
17CV193393-025

17CV193735
17CV193837
18CV194769
18CV194954
18CV195087
18CV195233
18CV195749
18CV195900
18CV195941

18CV196262
18CV196503
18CV196520
18CV196521
18CV196580
18CV196581
18TX007076
18TX007111

18TX007113
18TX007133
18TX007142
18TX007190
17CV192907
17CV193150
17TX006974
18CV194504

18CV195102
18CV195465
18CV195600
18CV196000
18CV196059

18CV196146
18CV196216
18CV196257
18CV196264
18CV196281
18CV196329

02/04/20

Lorain County Sheriff's Office

339 Roxboro Road Vermilion, Oh 44089

133 Ashland Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

28159 West Road Spencer, Oh 44275

Vacant Lot With Out Building Also Know As 44544 Stewart Road Sullivan Ohii

1540 Peach Drive Avon, Oh 44011

2516 West 40Th Street Lorain, Oh 44053

12563 Alton Road Grafton, Oh 44044

39325 Chestnut Ridge Road Elyria, Oh 44035

604 East 33Rd Street Lorain, Oh 44055

128 Blake Street Elyria, Oh 44035

10940 Hawke Road Columbia Station, Oh 44622

358 Oxford Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

36100 Sugar Ridge Road & Rear Land North North Ridgeville, Oh 44039

1900 Grafton Road Elyria, Oh 44035

1605 Cedar Drive Lorain, Oh 44052

3878 Woodworth Drive Lorain, Oh 44053
4133 Black River Circle Lorain, Oh 44055
6527 Hersey Circle North Ridgeville, Oh 44039
851 Allison Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052

1017 West 17Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052
7075 Freeland Drive Elyria, Oh 44035

2151 East 30Th Street Lorain, Oh 44055
2218 Larkmoor Street Lorain, Oh 44052
Vacant Lot Fka W 14Th St Lorain, Oh 44052
1106 West 21St Street Lorain, Oh 44052
9627 Patricia Court Elyria, Oh 44035

41396 Elmwood Street Elyria, Oh 44035
304-306 West 9Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052
45605 Telegraph Road Elyria, Oh 44035

536 Appomattox Court Lagrange, Oh 44050

2255 Adams Street Lorain, Oh 44052

38032 Edge Meadow Court North Ridgeville, Oh 44039
258 Oakwood Street Elyria, Oh 44035

232 Boston Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

411 North Abbe Road Elyria, Oh 44035

1132 West 30Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052

107 Dorset Court Elyria, Oh 44035

106 Lakewood Drive Avon Lake, Oh 44012

120 Hale Street Wellington, Oh 44090

1207 Unit A2 West River Road Elyria, Oh 44035
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Appraisal Amount

$144,000.00
$141,000.00
$756,000.00

$300,000.00
$81,000.00
$63,000.00
$123,000.00
$42,000.00
$30,000.00
$126,000.00
$99,000.00
$84,000.00

$120,000.00
$69,000.00
$210,000.00
$51,000.00
$180,000.00
$57,000.00

$129,000.00
$60,000.00

$138,000.00

$300,000.00
$63,000.00
$231,000.00
$60,000.00
$69,000.00

$99,000.00
$57,000.00
$48,000.00
$96,000.00
$87,000.00
$60,000.00

Sale Price

Cancelled
Cancelled
Cancelled
Cancelled

$265,000.00
$59,000.00
$42,000.00
Cancelled
$28,000.00
$20,000.00
$140,000.00
$66,000.00
$91,200.00

$135,000.00
No Bid  $26,600.00
Cancelled
$57,700.00
Cancelled
$42,704.39
No Bid
$54,000.00
No Bid
Cancelled
No Bid
$10,300.00
$109,357.66
Cancelled
$14,991.12
Cancelled

Cancelled
No Bid
Cancelled

$31,382.76

$78,210.00

$66,500.00
$38,000.00

$90,932.28
Sale Vacated
$61,000.00

01-00-002-111-068
10-00-005-101-165
21-17-019-000-005
21-15-000-000-025,
21-17-017-000-001,
21-17-016-000-010
04-00-028-102-135
02-02-013-109-029
11-00-036-118-005
10-00-005-107-013
03-00-098-127-013
06-24-009-107-004
11-00-008-000-063
06-25-075-102-035
07-00-026-101-053
07-00-026-101-012
10-00-005-105-001
03-00-057-109-010
02-02-012-114-077
03-00-079-126-011
07-00-009-120-187
02-02-027-113-006
02-01-006-134-020
06-24-046-107-006
03-00-094-105-035
03-00-049-123-006
02-01-003-131-027
02-01-006-144-033
10-00-001-102-076
06-22-018-120-041
02-01-004-109-021
05-00-048-000-056
05-00-049-000-025
15-00-035-000-075
03-00-049-119-014
07-00-042-101-106
10-00-004-124-025
06-25-013-110-010,
06-25-013-110-011
06-25-022-103-076
02-01-006-169-024
06-25-026-108-007
04-00-030-116-020
18-00-021-111-006
06-24-171-702-005



Sale Date

05/08/19
05/22/19
05/22/19

05/22/19
05/22/19
05/22/19

05/22/19
05/22/19
05/22/19
05/22/19
05/22/19
05/22/19
05/22/19
05/22/19
05/22/19
05/22/19
05/22/19
05/22/19
05/22/19
05/22/19
06/05/19
06/05/19
06/05/19
06/05/19

06/05/19
06/05/19
06/05/19
06/05/19
06/05/19
06/05/19
06/05/19
06/05/19
06/05/19
06/05/19
06/05/19
06/05/19
06/05/19
06/05/19

Updated:

Case Number

18TX007087
11CV171580
14CV184972

16CV189031
17CV193131
17CV193987

18CV194842
18CV195703
18CV196131
18CV196379
18CV196490
18CV196608
18CV196697
18CV196740
18TX007119
18TX007136
18TX007139
18TX007143
18TX007147
18TX007175
16TX006643
17CV193310
18CV194548
18CV194820

18CV194899
18CV195675
18CV195832
18CV196157
18CV196339
18CV196448
18CV196843
18TX007075
18TX007091

18TX007124
18TX007128
18TX007150
18TX007163
18TX007167

02/04/20

Lorain County Sheriff's Office

2410 East 32Nd Street Lorain, Oh 44052
845 Horseshoe Way Avon Lake, Oh 44012
3830 Lorain Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055

2958 Lexington Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052
977 Fairwood Boulevard Elyria, Oh 44035
47285 State Route 20 Oberlin, Oh 44074

4527 Tacoma Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055

114 Shakespeare Lane Avon, Oh 44011
39591 Penny Lane Elyria, Oh 44035

301 Furnace Street Elyria, Oh 44035

328 Foster Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

409 Berry Ridge Drive Amherst, Oh 44001
438 Maple Avenue Amherst, Oh 44001

1309 Meister Road Lorain, Oh 44053

1020 West 19Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052
945 Brownell Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052

1969 Nichols Street Lorain, Oh 44053

1964 East 29Th Street Lorain, Oh 44055
2040 Midway Mall Elyria, Oh 44035

763 University Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

365 Quarter Horse Lane Lagrange, Oh 44050
2101 West Erie Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052
5278 Mills Creek Lane North Ridgeville, Oh 44039

16-00-003-104-013 Vacant Land Willow Street, 2407.83 Feet From Grafton R

2251 Center Road Avon, Oh 44011

383 Hawthorne Street Elyria, Oh 44035

28391 Hawley Road Sullivan, Oh 44880

215 Brookfield Road Avon Lake, Oh 44012
34360 Cooley Road Eaton Township, Oh 44028
1110 Riverside Drive Elyria, Oh 44035

2633 G Street Lorain, Oh 44052

1103 Washington Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052
501 West 28Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052

4820 Broadway Lorain, Oh 44052

1901-1903 East 30Th Street Lorain, Oh 44055
511 South Abbe Road Elyria, Oh 44035

926 West Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

930 West Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035
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Appraisal Amount Sale Price
No Bid
$249,000.00 $240,000.00
$63,000.00 Cancelled
$51,000.00 Cancelled
$57,000.00 $38,000.00
$150,000.00 Cancelled
$48,000.00 No Bid $17,600.00
$108,000.00 $82,000.00
$99,000.00 $66,000.00
$45,000.00 $39,519.43
$63,000.00
$180,000.00 $136,900.00
$90,000.00 $60,000.00
$81,000.00 Cancelled
Cancelled
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
Cancelled
Cancelled
$13,985.20
$81,000.00 $59,000.00
$162,000.00 $140,700.00
$321,000.00 No Bid
$225,000.00 Cancelled
$66,000.00 $44,000.00
$222,000.00 Sale Vacated
$87,000.00 Cancelled
$66,000.00 $60,500.00
$48,000.00 NoBid $16,600.00
$51,000.00 $34,000.00
No Bid
No Bid
Cancelled
No Bid
Cancelled
$11,000.00
$5,641.32

03-00-081-105-003
04-00-029-000-667
03-00-101-116-023
03-00-101-116-024
03-00-101-116-025
02-01-003-201-021
06-25-028-105-078
14-00-028-000-004,
14-00-028-000-016
03-00-077-104-002
04-00-022-701-038
10-00-004-142-018
06-24-158-000-003
06-24-053-102-004
05-00-057-000-236
05-00-024-113-020
02-02-015-103-006
02-01-006-138-029
02-02-026-116-014
02-02-023-109-026
03-00-095-109-017
06-24-030-000-119
06-25-002-113-057
15-00-098-107-019
02-02-029-105-008
07-00-007-130-070
16-00-003-104-013
16-00-004-000-009
16-00-003-104-012
16-00-004-000-008
16-00-003-105-024
04-00-015-110-281
06-25-020-106-001
21-15-000-000-068
04-00-018-114-002
11-00-013-000-024
06-26-016-102-003
03-00-048-111-018
02-01-006-123-001
02-01-003-197-007
03-00-113-101-005
03-00-095-109-023
06-25-012-106-007
06-26-018-102-003
06-26-018-102-004



Sale Date

06/05/19
06/05/19
06/11/19

06/19/19
06/19/19
06/19/19
06/19/19
06/19/19
06/19/19
06/19/19
06/19/19
06/19/19
06/19/19

06/19/19
06/19/19
06/19/19
06/19/19

06/19/19
06/19/19

06/19/19
06/19/19
06/19/19
06/19/19
06/19/19

07/03/19
07/03/19
07/03/19
07/03/19
07/03/19
07/03/19
07/03/19
07/03/19
07/03/19
07/03/19
07/03/19
07/03/19

Case Number

18TX007209
18TX007218

19TX007241-021

17CV191396
17CV193570
17CV193605
18CV194334
18CV194356
18CV195184
18CV195634
18CV196075
18CV196186
18CV196260

18CV196603
18CV196698
18CV196778
18CV196823

18CV196868
18CV196954

18TX007085

18TX007095-008
18TX007095-010

18TX007170
18TX007213

16CV190291
17CV192334
18CV194533
18CV195243
18CV195329
18CV195330
18CV195393
18CV195766
18CV196164
18CV196695
18CV196803
18CV196908

Updated:  02/04/20

Lorain County Sheriff's Office

290 East 46Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052
216 Thelma Drive Sheffield Lake, Oh 44054

246 Sumner Street And Adjacent Rear Land 102' X 66' Oberlin, Oh 44074

1730 Fairway Drive Lorain, Oh 44053

1306 West 17Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052

4048 Kenyon Avenue Lorain, Oh 44053

305 Falling Water Circle Amherst, Oh 44001

162 West Martin Avenue Amherst, Oh 44001

645 Lucille Drive Elyria, Oh 44035

34934 Northview Circle North Ridgeville, Oh 44039
112 Meadowfield Court Elyria, Oh 44035

1917 Grafton Road Elyria, Oh 44035

989 Oakwood Drive Elyria, Oh 44035

35031 East Road Grafton, Oh 44044

458 Maple Avenue Amherst, Oh 44001
1639 School Street Sheffield Township, Oh
3113 Toledo Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055

160 Beebe Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035
826 Lafayette Boulevard Sheffield Lake, Oh 44054

930 West 17Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052
113 Morgan Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035
121 Morgan Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035
45525 Telegraph Road Elyria, Oh 44035
2325 Wilson Street Lorain, Oh 44055

9008 Stonegate Circle North Ridgeville, Oh 44039
6398 Mills Creek Lane North Ridgeville, Oh 44039
1600 West 35Th Street Lorain, Oh 44053

1285 Meadowview Lane Amherst, Oh 44001

511 West 17Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052

812 West 23Rd Street Lorain, Oh 44052

Vacant Land Fka - 811 Sycamore Street Elyria, Oh 44035

617 Delaware Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

6136 Mills Creek Lane North Ridgeville, Oh 44039
50923 Becker Road Oberlin, Oh 44074

333 West 25Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052

125 Eastern Heights Boulevard Elyria, Oh 44035
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Appraisal Amount

$105,000.00
$39,000.00
$102,000.00
$225,000.00
$105,000.00
$90,000.00
$99,000.00
$87,000.00
$99,000.00
$87,000.00

$36,000.00
$72,000.00
$36,000.00
$30,000.00

$93,000.00
$75,000.00

$141,000.00
$84,000.00
$150,000.00
$12,000.00
$15,000.00
$15,000.00
$60,000.00
$135,000.00
$201,000.00
$12,000.00
$87,000.00

Sale Price

Cancelled

Cancelled

Cancelled

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Cancelled
No Bid

No Bid

$23,752.17

$21,300.00

$70,000.00

$68,000.00
$200,000.00
$95,000.00
$60,000.00
$90,700.00
$58,290.00
$66,000.00
$58,000.00

$60,000.00
$24,000.00
$65,000.00

$80,000.00

$35,000.00

$90,100.00
$170,000.00
$8,000.00
$10,000.00
$10,000.00
$40,000.00
$140,000.00
$175,000.00
$2,000.00
$58,000.00

03-00-108-107-008
03-00-032-105-031
09-00-096-108-021
09-00-096-108-016
09-00-096-108-017
02-02-007-109-024
02-02-025-108-022
02-02-008-102-014
05-00-005-106-032
05-00-018-106-031
06-25-032-115-020
07-00-016-801-001
06-23-013-105-054
10-00-004-128-009
06-24-025-104-015,
06-24-025-104-016
11-00-036-115-003
05-00-024-113-021
03-00-111-104-010
03-00-098-118-011
03-00-098-118-012
06-25-020-107-019
03-00-037-116-009
03-00-037-116-010
03-00-037-116-008
03-00-037-116-011
02-01-006-130-027
06-24-035-106-008
06-24-035-106-010
05-00-048-000-033
03-00-075-102-008,
03-00-075-102-009
07-00-036-000-297
07-00-005-103-060
02-02-015-106-018
02-02-002-000-042
02-01-003-144-005
02-01-006-155-028
06-25-022-105-025
06-25-002-104-068
07-00-005-105-028
08-12-015-000-003
02-01-003-187-025
06-25-005-101-009



Sale Date
07/03/19

07/03/19
07/03/19
07/03/19
07/03/19
07/03/19
07/03/19
07/03/19
07/03/19
07/03/19
07/17/19

07/17/19
07/17/19

07/17/19
07/17/19

07/17/19

07/17/19
07/17/19
07/17/19
07/17/19
07/17/19
07/17/19
07/17/19
07/17/19
07/17/19
07/17/19

07/17/19
07/17/19
07/17/19
07/17/19
07/17/19

07/17/19

Updated:

Case Number

18TX007060

18TX007160
18TX007164
18TX007168
18TX007177
18TX007193
18TX007204
18TX007205
18TX007210
19CV197143
16CV189044

17CV191634
17CV192216

17CV193610
17CV193860

18CV194250

18CV194736
18CV194953
18CV195227
18CV195600
18CV195787
18CV196321
18CV196696
18CV196712
18CV196727
18CV196953

18TX007144
18TX007155
18TX007166
18TX007199
18TX007214

19CV197105

02/04/20

Lorain County Sheriff's Office
Vacant 49.50' X 202.29' Lot Located Directly Northeast Of 621 West River Ro

993 Fairwood Boulevard Elyria, Oh 44035

2926 Garfield Boulevard Lorain, Oh 44052

228 Samuel Street Elyria, Oh 44035

430 Broadway Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052

317 Oxford Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

Vacant Lot Located On The South Side Of 6Th Court, Lorain Oh 44052 And &
2524 Reid Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052

617 Dewitt Street Lorain, Oh 44055

311 West 23Rd Street Lorain, Oh 44052

6482 Lear Nagle Road North Ridgeville, Oh 44039

116 lllinois Circle Elyria, Oh 44035
4755 Park Drive Sheffield Lake, Oh 44054

814 Sandalwood Drive Elyria, Oh 44035
Upon P.P. No 02-01-005-120-021 Commonly Known As: 914 W 10Th St(1(]Uy

93 Pike Court Lagrange, Oh 44050

11000 North Durkee Road Grafton, Oh 44044

717 Stanford Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

106 Mill Stream Circle Elyria, Oh 44035

38032 Edge Meadow Court North Ridgeville, Oh 44039

49881 State Route 113 Aka 49881 Telegraph Road Amherst, Oh 44001
205 Jaycox Road Avon Lake, Oh 44012

341 12Th Street Elyria, Oh 44035

3885 Meadow Lane Lorain, Oh 44055

831 Longson Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

609 West Shore Boulevard Sheffield Lake, Oh 44054

1622 Broadway, Lorain Oh 44052 And 1624 Broadway, Apt 1, 2, And 3, Lorair
An Irregularly Shaped Vacant Lot Located 84.75" East Of The Intersection Of
504 West 24Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052

1541 East Erie Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052

1126 West 21St St, Lorain Ohio 44052 And Adjacent Vacant Lot W. 21St St. L

766 Pasadena Avenue Sheffield Lake, Oh 44054
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Appraisal Amount

$15,000.00
$216,000.00

$120,000.00
$600,000.00

$93,000.00

$126,000.00
$69,000.00
$180,000.00
$231,000.00
$108,000.00
$192,000.00
$48,000.00
$18,000.00
$57,000.00
$126,000.00

$42,000.00

Sale Price
No Bid
$41,500.00
No Bid
$26,000.00
$42,000.00
$21,000.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$10,000.00
Cancelled
Cancelled
$400,000.00
$67,000.00
No Bid
No Bid
Cancelled
Cancelled
$145,000.00
Cancelled
Cancelled
$156,500.00
$38,000.00
No Bid  $38,000.00
Cancelled
$22,645.51
No Bid
No Bid
$115,200.00
No Bid
$45,000.00

VACANT 49.5'X
202.29' LOT
LOCATED
DIRECTLY
NORTHEAST OF
621 WEST RIVER
ROAD
06-24-137-000-001
06-25-028-105-046
03-00-047-111-014
06-24-035-102-024
02-01-004-102-010
06-25-075-103-004
02-01-005-113-034
02-01-003-187-019
03-00-103-121-041
02-01-003-178-005
07-00-009-113-024,
07-00-009-113-062
06-25-002-111-026
03-00-037-101-029,
03-00-037-101-032
06-23-030-106-017
02-01-005-120-021,
02-01-005-120-022
15-00-099-102-078,
15-00-099-102-109
11-00-088-000-009
06-25-002-102-030
11-00-091-000-056
07-00-042-101-106
08-00-091-000-038
04-00-019-129-011
06-26-010-101-009
03-00-080-107-007
06-25-006-128-021
03-00-038-114-003
03-00-038-114-004
02-01-003-141-023
02-01-006-159-017
02-01-003-176-015
02-00-051-101-024
02-01-006-144-025,
02-01-006-144-026
03-00-039-118-059



Sale Date

07/17/19
07/17/19
07/31/19
07/31/19
07/31/19
07/31/19
07/31/19
07/31/19
07/31/19
07/31/19
07/31/19
07/31/19
07/31/19
07/31/19
07/31/19

07/31/19
07/31/19
07/31/19
08/14/19
08/14/19
08/14/19

08/14/19
08/14/19

08/14/19
08/14/19
08/14/19
08/14/19
08/14/19
08/14/19
08/14/19
08/14/19
08/14/19
08/14/19
08/14/19
08/14/19
08/14/19
08/14/19
08/14/19
08/28/19

Updated: 02/04/20 1:07:10PM

Case Number

19CV197217
19TX007231
14CV184545
17CV191966
18CV195807
18CV195973
18CV196218
18CV196869
18CV196888
18TX007094
18TX007126-002
18TX007126-035
18TX007211
19CV197020
19CV197039

19CV197084
19CV197198
19CV197234
16CV188796
16CV190291
17CV193930

18CV194911
18CV195632

18CV195786
18CV196580
18CV196804
18CV196844
18TX007198
18TX007203
18TX007219
19CV197158
19CV197231
19CV197232
19CV197339
19CV197430
19CV197611
19CV197675
19TX007225
14CV183013

Lorain County Sheriff's Office

816 West 23Rd Street Lorain, Oh 44052

Vacant Lot Located Directly South Of 1008 West Ave. And Directly North Of 1
342 Bounty Way Avon Lake, Oh 44012

33649 St Francis Drive Avon, Oh 44011

150 Taft Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

616 Delaware Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

3455 Dayton Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055

4158 Belle Avenue Sheffield Lake, Oh 44054

4355 Marina Drive Vermilion, Oh 44089

154 Edgewood Street Elyria, Oh 44035

5532 West Erie Avenue Lorain, Oh 44053

3874 Fulton Road Lorain, Oh 44055

Vacant Lot Located On The South Side Of 6Th Court Lorain Oh 44052 And S
250 George Street Elyria, Oh 44035

5931 Avon Belden Road North Ridgeville, Oh 44039
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10808 Lagrange Road Elyria, Oh 44035

11060 Island Road Grafton, Oh 44044

208 West 27Th Street Lorain, Oh 44055

10131 Dupont Drive Columbia Station, Oh 44622
9008 Stonegate Circle North Ridgeville, Oh 44039
5150 Longbrook Road Lorain, Oh 44053

NDNNOO®

5344 Mills Creek Lane North Ridgeville, Oh 44039
840 Devonshire Avenue Sheffield Lake, Oh 44054

611 Keys Drive Elyria, Oh 44035

6527 Hersey Circle North Ridgeville, Oh 44039
862 Harris Road Sheffield Lake, Oh 44054

10 Phillips Court Elyria, Oh 44035

5411 Ridgewood Street Lorain, Oh 44055
Vacant Land Located Directly Between 260 Lincoln St. And 224 Lincoln St., C
1656 West 33Rd Street Lorain, Oh 44055

2846 Mckinley Street Lorain, Oh 44052

5755 Firecrest Circle North Ridgeville, Oh 44039
2202 Wilson Drive Lorain, Oh 44052

5534 Edgewood Drive Lorain, Oh 44053

902 Deer Run Drive Amherst, Oh 44001

216 Sheila Drive Wellington, Oh 44090

323 West 21St Street Lorain, Oh 44052

1601 Cedar Drive Lorain, Oh 44052

7387 Dyke Avenue North Ridgeville, Oh 44039
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Appraisal Amount
$18,000.00

$339,000.00
$444,000.00
$45,000.00
$45,000.00

$90,000.00
$228,000.00

$39,000.00
$132,000.00

$123,000.00
$75,000.00
$39,000.00
$90,000.00
$150,000.00
$186,000.00

$150,000.00
$90,000.00

$60,000.00
$180,000.00
$96,000.00
$63,000.00

$36,000.00
$135,000.00
$66,000.00
$75,000.00
$129,000.00
$132,000.00
$36,000.00

Sale Price

$55,560.09
No Bid
Cancelled
Cancelled
$30,000.00
$30,000.00
Cancelled
Sale Vacated
Cancelled
Cancelled
Cancelled
Cancelled
No Bid

$140,000.00

Sale Vacated
$50,000.00
No Bid $15,000.00
Cancelled
Cancelled
Cancelled

Sale Vacated

$110,275.38
$40,100.00
$150,000.00
$90,000.00
$52,440.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
$24,000.00

Cancelled
$44,000.00
$50,000.00
$110,000.00
Sale Vacated

$24,000.00
$14,709.99

Sale Vacated

02-01-006-155-027
06-26-015-101-003
04-00-030-144-014
04-00-024-114-007
06-24-055-103-005
06-25-002-102-019
02-01-003-232-007
03-00-029-103-012
01-00-017-000-109
06-25-014-102-016
02-03-001-101-002
03-00-101-108-035
02-01-005-113-035
06-26-011-101-005
07-00-020-101-022,
07-00-020-101-081
10-00-008-111-019
11-00-034-000-020
02-01-003-191-014
12-00-020-112-005
07-00-036-000-297
02-03-006-102-019
02-03-006-102-020
02-03-006-102-008
07-00-007-130-074
0300044105056
0300044105010
0300044105009
06-24-028-104-018
07-00-009-120-187
03-00-038-125-067
06-24-158-000-012
03-00-109-131-009
09-00-095-102-009
03-00-096-106-016
03-00-047-121-008
07-00-005-108-010
03-00-049-119-001
02-02-005-112-005
05-00-057-000-153
18-00-028-101-103
02-01-003-167-001
03-00-057-109-009
07-00-046-104-005,
07-00-046-104-009



Sale Date

08/28/19
08/28/19
08/28/19
08/28/19
08/28/19
08/28/19
08/28/19
08/28/19
08/28/19

08/28/19
08/28/19
08/28/19
08/28/19
08/28/19
08/28/19
08/28/19
08/28/19
08/28/19
08/28/19
08/28/19
09/11/19

09/11/19
09/11/19
09/11/19

09/11/19
09/11/19

09/11/19
09/11/19
09/11/19

09/11/19
09/11/19

Updated:

Case Number

16TX006692
17CV191311
17CV193928
18CV194394
18CV194899
18CV196023
18CV196281
18CV196328
18CV196338

18CV196809
18CV196824
18TX007141
18TX007157
18TX007191
18TX007222
19CV197353
19CV197408
19CV197442
19CV197706
19CV197754
14CV183462

14CV184592
18CV194421
18CV195633

18CV196157
18CV196638

18TX007151
18TX007172
18TX007207

19CV197202
19CV197351

02/04/20

Lorain County Sheriff's Office

433 10Th Street Elyria, Oh 44035

195 Beachwood Avenue Avon Lake, Oh 44012
45705 Middle Ridge Road Amherst, Oh 44001
8749 West Ridge Road Unit B Elyria, Oh 44035
2251 Center Road Avon, Oh 44011

508 West 24Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052

120 Hale Street Wellington, Oh 44090

1008 West 5Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052

10060 Avon Belden Road Grafton, Oh 44044

98 Edgewood Drive Grafton, Oh 44044
41866 Adelbert Road Elyria, Oh 44035
2616 Reid Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055

510 Georgetown Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

Vacant Lot Located Directly Between 326 Bellaire Road And 332 Bellaire Roa
A Vacant Lot Located Directly Between 1746 Washington Ave And 1732 Wast

15 Bunker Hill Elyria, Oh 44035

2100 West 40Th Street Lorain, Oh 44053

34129 Bainbridge Road North Ridgeville, Oh 44039
540 Furnace Street Elyria, Oh 44035

1812-1814 Washington Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052
52868 State Route 113 Wakeman, Oh 44889

36792 Law Road Grafton, Oh 44044
9885 East River Road Columbia Station, Oh 44028
658 Alameda Avenue Sheffield Lake, Oh 44054

215 Brookfield Road Avon Lake, Oh 44012
4409 Tennyson Avenue Sheffield Lake, Oh 44054

939 Dillewood Avenue Sheffield Lake, Oh 44054
804 West 23Rd Street Lorain, Oh 44052

Upon P.P. No: 03-00-096-121-001, And 03-00-096-121-002 [I(1[]C:Commonly

209 Westminster Way Elyria, Oh 44035
6129 Dorwood Drive Lorain, Oh 44053
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Appraisal Amount

$174,000.00
$66,000.00

$225,000.00
$21,000.00
$87,000.00
$39,000.00
$111,000.00

$90,000.00
$51,000.00

$27,000.00
$75,000.00
$153,000.00
$42,000.00
$54,000.00
$492,000.00

$75,000.00
$99,000.00

$87,000.00
$261,000.00

$162,000.00
$90,000.00

Sale Price
$141,000.00
Sale Vacated
Cancelled
$190,000.00
$14,000.00
Sale Vacated
$26,000.00
$74,000.00
$102,000.00
$36,000.00
$8,968.21
$32,242.48
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid  $10,000.00
$75,000.00
$105,100.00
$34,000.00
$45,600.00
Cancelled
Cancelled
$50,000.00
$66,000.00
$90,000.00
$174,000.00
Cancelled
No Bid
No Bid
Cancelled
No Bid $43,600.00

06-26-017-000-041
04-00-007-129-003
05-00-045-000-029
06-24-003-701-007
04-00-015-110-281
02-01-003-176-014
18-00-021-111-006
02-01-005-105-008
11-00-051-000-048
11-00-051-000-058
11-00-051-000-072
10-00-015-105-007
06-24-037-103-036
02-01-003-190-020
06-25-024-101-012
04-00-018-119-023
02-01-006-134-037
06-24-030-702-001
02-02-014-113-020
07-00-015-108-032
06-24-050-104-010
02-01-006-138-033
08-00-097-000-055,
08-20-025-000-036
16-00-064-000-014
12-00-021-105-005
03-00-039-115-042,
03-00-039-115-043,
03-00-039-115-044
04-00-018-114-002
03-00-039-105-023,
0300039105024,
0300039105025,
0300039105004,
0300039105005,
0300039105006
03-00-044-111-015
02-01-006-155-030
03-00-096-121-001,
03-00-096-121-002,
03-00-100-101-001,
03-00-100-101-002,
03-00-100-101-003
11-00-090-000-061
05-00-080-105-011



Sale Date

09/11/19
09/11/19
09/11/19
09/11/19

09/11/19
09/11/19
09/11/19
09/11/19
09/11/19
09/11/19
09/11/19
09/11/19
09/25/19
09/25/19

09/25/19
09/25/19
09/25/19
09/25/19
09/25/19

09/25/19
09/25/19
09/25/19
09/25/19

09/25/19
09/25/19
09/25/19
09/25/19
09/25/19
09/25/19
10/09/19
10/09/19

10/09/19
10/09/19

10/09/19
10/09/19

Case Number

19CV197538
19CV197763
19TX007224
19TX007228

19TX007234
19TX007237
19TX007238

19TX007241-006

19TX007243
19TX007248
19TX007268
19TX007297
09CV160540
16CV189044

17CV194077
18CV195600
18CV196386
18CV196783
18CV196965

18TX007196
18TX007197
18TX007215
18TX007220

19CV197040
19CV197218
19CV197347
19CV197762
19CV197844
19TX007249
17CV191600
18CV194820

18CV194893
18TX007162

18TX007189
18TX007194

Updated:  02/04/20

Lorain County Sheriff's Office

1236 West 7Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052
2520 West Skyline Drive Lorain, Oh 44052
2370 East 41St Street Lorain, Oh 44055

Vacant Lots Totaling 120' X 118.50 ' Located On The West Side Of Oliver Stre

4700 Norfolk Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055
729 Dunney Avenue Sheffield Lake, Oh 44054

5141 Broadway Lorain, Oh 44052
A Vacant Land Locked Parcel 100" X 126.05' Starting 198' West Of The West
Vacant Land Approximately 4.6 Acres Located Directly Between 31936 Mills F

12411 Alton Drive Grafton, Oh 44044

An Irregular Shaped Vacant Lot Approximately 51.50 Acres Located On The V
Vacant Lot Located Directly Between 654 Hollywood Avenue And 646 Hollywc

475 East College Street Oberlin, Oh 44074
6482 Lear Nagle Road North Ridgeville, Oh 44039

3942 Woodworth Drive Lorain, Oh 44053

38032 Edge Meadow Court North Ridgeville, Oh 44039
33981 Adams Street North Ridgeville, Oh 44039

924 Fairwood Boulevard Elyria, Oh 44035

102 Middle Street Wellington, Oh 44090

203 West 28Th Street Lorain, Oh 44055
6061 Grace Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035
1418 West 19Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052
2047 Cleveland Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055

109 Mckinley Street Wellington, Oh 44090

849 Delaware Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

924 Devonshire Drive Sheffield Lake, Oh 44054
3110 Lincoln Street Lorain, Oh 44052

1302 West Erie Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052

Vacant Land Located Directly West Of 130 W Bridge St Elyria, Oh 44035

643 Sunnyside Road Vermilion, Oh 44089

16-00-003-104-013 Vacant Land Willow Street, 2407.83 Feet From Grafton R

3265 Cooper Foster Park Road Vermilion, Oh 44089

03-00-033-114-001 Vacant Lot Located On The South Side Of Walker Road,

333 lllinois Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052
735 Allison Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052

1:07:10PM
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Appraisal Amount

$42,000.00
$141,000.00

$141,000.00
$216,000.00

$201,000.00
$231,000.00
$171,000.00
$99,000.00
$45,000.00

$87,000.00
$60,000.00
$141,000.00
$45,000.00
$39,000.00

$180,000.00
$321,000.00

$240,000.00

Sale Price
Cancelled
Cancelled
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$43,500.00
No Bid
No Bid $2,563.63
$50,000.00
No Bid
Cancelled
No Bid
$94,000.00
Cancelled
$192,800.00
$212,000.00
Cancelled
Cancelled
$30,000.00
Cancelled
$32,600.00
No Bid
$70,200.00
$40,000.00
$130,000.00
No Bid  $28,470.44
$41,100.00
No Bid
$120,000.00
$321,000.00
Cancelled
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

02-02-026-110-005
02-02-013-101-048
03-00-079-108-002
03-00-042-117-043
03-00-042-117-077
03-00-077-105-028
03-00-040-119-051
03-00-113-104-077
09-00-075-109-006
04-00-025-000-047
11-00-036-115-016
04-00-016-101-202
03-00-039-112-040
09-00-087-107-015
07-00-009-113-024,
07-00-009-113-062
02-02-012-114-053
07-00-042-101-106
07-00-009-111-043
06-25-028-106-018
20-05-022-105-003,
20-05-017-105-015
02-01-003-199-007
06-22-018-120-048
02-02-025-113-020
03-00-109-104-050,
03-00-109-104-051,
03-00-109-104-052
18-00-022-104-010
06-25-002-104-039
03-00-044-109-041
03-00-047-124-012
02-02-026-103-022
06-26-070-000-004
01-00-005-104-010
16-00-003-104-013
16-00-004-000-009
16-00-003-104-012
16-00-004-000-008
16-00-003-105-024
01-00-036-000-046
03-00-038-115-001
03-00-033-114-001
02-00-051-103-067
02-02-027-112-004



Sale Date

10/09/19
10/09/19
10/09/19
10/09/19
10/09/19
10/09/19
10/09/19
10/09/19
10/09/19
10/09/19
10/09/19
10/09/19
10/09/19
10/09/19
10/09/19
10/23/19
10/23/19
10/23/19
10/23/19
10/23/19
10/23/19
10/23/19
10/23/19
10/23/19
10/23/19
10/23/19
10/23/19
10/23/19
10/23/19
10/23/19
11/06/19
11/06/19
11/06/19
11/06/19
11/06/19
11/06/19
11/06/19
11/06/19
11/06/19

11/06/19
11/06/19
11/06/19

Updated:

Case Number

19CV197175
19CV197295
19CV197560
19CV197669
19CV197671
19CV197680
19CV197693
19CV197945
19CV197950
19TX007232
19TX007235
19TX007250
19TX007266-005
19TX007266-056
19TX007283
10TX006341
18CV194404
18CV194953
18CV196300
18CV196520
18CV196740
18CV196786
18CV196888
18CV196929
18TX007146
18TX007174
19CV198079
19TX007254
19TX007262
19TX007311
09CV163926
13CV179274
17CV193768
18CV195008
18CV195832
18CV196494
18TX007119
18TX007159
19CV197053

19CV197066

19CV197188
19CV197200

02/04/20

Lorain County Sheriff's Office

1401 Root Road Lorain, Oh 44052

2780 Utica Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052

12536 Alton Drive Grafton, Oh 44044

532 Cornell Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

6908 Root Road North Ridgeville, Oh 44039

9876 Jaquay Road Columbia Station, Oh 44028

1524 New Jersey Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052

325 Winckles Street Elyria, Oh 44035

10321 Aspen Court Elyria, Oh 44035

A Vacant Lot 40.66' X 66' Directly North Of 71 Chestnut Street, Elyria, Oh 44C
3426 Oakdale Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055

312 Winckles Street Elyria, Oh 44035

3135 Camden Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055

Vacant Lot 88' X 492.92' X 88' X 492.74' Located On The Easterly Side Of Av
Vacant Lot 40" X 110' And Located Directly North Of 3317 Lowell Avenue Lore
2107 Roosevelt Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052

2336 East 32Nd Street Lorain, Oh 44055

717 Stanford Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

37554 Stoney Lake Drive North Ridgeville, Oh 44039

3878 Woodworth Drive Lorain, Oh 44053

1309 Meister Road Lorain, Oh 44053

4252 Case Road Avon, Oh 44011

4355 Marina Drive Vermilion, Oh 44089

8955 Oberlin Road Elyria, Oh 44035

116 North Mill Street Wellington, Oh 44090

1608 Pennsylvania Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052

215 West 29Th Street Lorain, Oh 44055

1853 East 31St Street Lorain, Oh 44055

906 East Erie Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052

An Irregular Shaped Vacant Lot Located On The Corner Of Forest Lane And |
409 South Main Street Wellington, Oh 44090

1111 Park Avenue Amherst, Oh 44001

947 Osborne Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052

4043 Woodstock Drive Lorain, Oh 44053

28391 Hawley Road Sullivan, Oh 44880

4211 Clinton Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055

1020 West 19Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052

4860 Oberlin Avenue Lorain, Oh 44053

4137 Russell Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055

1816 Madison Avenue Lorain, Oh 44053
122 Bell Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035
5470 Main Street North Ridgeville, Oh 44039
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Appraisal Amount

$42,000.00
$75,000.00
$54,000.00
$57,000.00
$78,000.00
$75,000.00
$45,000.00
$51,000.00
$252,000.00

$63,000.00
$69,000.00
$189,000.00
$210,000.00
$81,000.00
$162,000.00
$228,000.00
$147,000.00

$36,000.00

$120,000.00
$162,000.00
$87,000.00
$108,000.00
$222,000.00
$57,000.00

$75,000.00
$30,000.00

$75,000.00
$75,000.00

Sale Price
$37,720.00
$50,000.00

No Bid $23,800.00
$62,202.18
Cancelled
$70,000.00
$48,600.00
$171,100.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid $8,868.68
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$61,600.00
Cancelled
$196,100.00
Cancelled
$54,000.00
$125,500.00
Cancelled
$98,000.00
$35,101.26
No Bid
$47,120.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
Cancelled
Cancelled
$58,000.00
Cancelled
Cancelled
No Bid
Cancelled
No Bid $5,000.00
$20,000.00
No Bid $100.00
$50,000.00

03-00-058-101-016
02-02-016-107-014
11-00-036-117-011
06-25-006-116-023
07-00-021-118-008
12-00-061-000-047
03-00-056-115-007
06-25-016-108-025
10-00-005-107-134
06-26-071-000-015
02-01-003-230-010
06-25-016-109-004
03-00-082-115-005
07-00-021-101-056
03-00-097-113-007
03-00-109-115-007
03-00-081-101-010
06-25-002-102-030
07-00-031-000-088
02-02-012-114-077
02-02-015-103-006
04-00-001-102-027
01-00-017-000-109
05-00-052-000-046
18-00-028-109-007
03-00-056-123-011
02-01-003-203-003
03-00-095-103-023
02-01-003-107-001
02-02-021-117-018
18-00-022-108-048
05-00-038-106-065
02-02-027-116-008
02-02-021-118-017
21-15-000-000-068
03-00-100-115-001
02-01-006-138-029
02-02-005-101-027
03-00-102-115-007,
03-00-103-126-014
02-02-023-109-053
06-24-026-117-012
07-00-007-120-053,
07-00-007-120-015,
07-00-007-120-016



Sale Date

11/06/19
11/06/19

11/06/19
11/06/19
11/06/19
11/06/19
11/20/19
11/20/19
11/20/19
11/20/19
11/20/19
11/20/19
11/20/19
11/20/19
11/20/19
11/20/19
11/20/19
11/20/19
11/20/19
11/20/19

11/20/19
11/20/19
11/20/19

11/20/19
11/20/19
11/20/19
11/20/19
11/20/19
11/20/19
12/04/19

12/04/19
12/04/19
12/04/19
12/04/19
12/04/19
12/04/19
12/04/19
12/04/19
12/04/19
12/04/19
12/04/19

Updated:

Case Number

19CV197431
19CV197521

19CV197538
19CV197703
19CV197870
19CV198003
13CV179650

17TX006983-006
17TX006983-023

18CV196159
18CV196446
18CV196471
18CV196895
18TX007202
19CV197084
19CV197824
19CV197857
19CV198035
19CV198159
19CV198354

19TX007252
19TX007257
19TX007259

19TX007271
19TX007282
19TX007293
19TX007295
19TX007301
19TX007306
14CV183462

16CV189031
17CV194104
18CV196382
18CV196523
18CV196548
18CV197000
19CV197189
19CV197600
19CV197623
19CV197632
19CV197765

02/04/20

Lorain County Sheriff's Office

3324 Coopers Trail Lorain, Oh 44053
142 Courtland Street Wellington, Oh 44090

1236 West 7Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052

107 Bath Street Elyria, Oh 44035

9410 Reed Road North Ridgeville, Oh 44039

Commonly Known As Vacant Land Between Krebs Road And Nagel Road An
711 Park Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

1415 West 21St Street Lorain, Oh 44052

1244 West 22Nd Street Lorain, Oh 44052

326 Marseilles Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

Commonly Known As Vacant Land 333.34 Feet East Of North Main Street We
5295 Liberty Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052

124 Miami Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

3645 Ada Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055

10808 Lagrange Road Elyria, Oh 44035

6221 West River Road South Elyria, Oh 44035

4627 Tacoma Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055

246 Courtland Street Elyria, Oh 44035

36920 West Royalton Road Grafton, Oh 44044

108 Winthrop Drive Elyria, Oh 44035

Vacant Land Located Directly Between 881 Oak St And 871 Oak St Elyria, Of
An Irregularly Shaped Vacant Lot Located On The Northerly Side Of Huron St
Two Vacant Lots Totaling 102/ X 99 65' X102' X 99.08' Located On The North

550 West College Street Oberlin, Oh 44074

A Vacant Lot Located Directly North Of 318 11Th Street Elyria, Oh 44035 And
A Vacant Lot 50' X 110" Located Directly West Of 404 Louisiana Avenue Elyric
425 12Th Street Elyria, Oh 44035

Vacant Lot Located Directly East And North Of 1765 East 29Th Street Lorain,
A Vacant Lot Located On The Westerly Side Of Dunny Avenue, Sheffield Lake
52868 State Route 113 Wakeman, Oh 44889

2958 Lexington Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055

506 Courtland Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

2407 Livingston Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052

202 Longford Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

4869 Joseph Court North Ridgeville, Oh 44039
410 East 45Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052

3066 Clifton Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055

1029 Greenwich Avenue Grafton, Oh 44044
40430 Webster Road Lagrange, Oh 44050
287 Courtland Street Elyria, Oh 44035

32767 Brookstone Lane #9 North Ridgeville, Oh 44039
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Appraisal Amount

$132,000.00
$141,000.00

$42,000.00
$51,000.00
$72,000.00
$600,000.00
$96,000.00

$69,000.00
$150,000.00
$60,000.00
$96,000.00

$123,000.00
$39,000.00
$54,000.00
$78,000.00
$204,000.00
$120,000.00

$492,000.00

$51,000.00
$153,000.00
$30,000.00
$54,000.00
$96,000.00
$84,000.00
$27,000.00
$111,000.00
$240,000.00
$57,000.00
$90,000.00

Sale Price
$150,000.00
$94,000.00
No Bid $21,562.33
$34,100.00
$48,000.00
Cancelled
Cancelled
Cancelled
Cancelled
Cancelled
$166,000.00
$40,000.00
$96,520.00
No Bid
$110,000.00
$26,000.00
$47,000.00
$52,100.00
Cancelled
$90,000.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$20,206.47
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$328,000.00
$34,000.00
Cancelled
$20,000.00
$36,000.00
$75,000.00
$65,000.00
$18,000.00
$97,000.00
$204,350.98
$38,100.00
$75,000.00

02-02-002-000-178
18-00-022-101-041
18-00-022-101-042
02-02-026-110-005
06-24-055-103-035
07-00-012-101-133
04-00-028-101-114
06-25-005-104-017
02-02-025-122-006
02-02-025-123-023
06-25-019-105-027
18-00-020-000-140
03-00-075-104-004
06-25-004-103-022
03-00-102-111-008
10-00-008-111-019
06-24-010-105-034
03-00-077-115-007
06-24-025-103-010
11-00-066-000-009
06-22-009-103-024,
06-22-009-103-030
06-24-026-109-013
06-24-106-000-017
03-00-039-105-035,
03-00-039-105-045
09-00-084-101-001
06-26-015-103-016
06-24-028-115-012
06-26-009-000-028
03-00-096-108-048
03-00-040-118-041
08-00-097-000-055,
08-20-025-000-036
02-01-003-201-021
06-24-023-102-004
02-01-003-180-009
06-25-019-107-029
07-00-017-107-003
03-00-108-106-014
03-00-098-118-026
11-00-082-000-071
15-00-094-000-004
06-24-025-102-020
07-00-005-703-009



Sale Date

12/04/19
12/04/19
12/04/19
12/04/19
12/04/19
12/04/19
12/04/19
12/04/19
12/04/19
12/04/19
12/04/19
12/04/19
12/18/19
12/18/19
12/18/19

12/18/19

12/18/19
12/18/19
12/18/19
12/18/19
12/18/19
12/18/19
12/18/19
12/18/19
12/18/19
12/18/19
12/18/19
12/18/19

12/18/19
12/18/19
12/18/19
12/18/19
12/18/19

12/18/19

Updated:

Case Number

19CV197783
19CV197805
19CV197860
19CV197998
19CV198046
19CV198078
19CV198084
19CV198211
19CV198241
19CV198427
19CV198593
19TX007314
17CV192836
18CV195102
18CV195953

18CV196399

18CV196530
18CV196572
18CV196754
18CV196888
18TX007080
18TX007171
19CV197159
19CV197504
19CV197861
19CV198004
19CV198264
19CV198444

19TX007229
19TX007246
19TX007255
19TX007275
19TX007316

19TX007319

02/04/20

Lorain County Sheriff's Office

2337 East 35Th Street Lorain, Oh 44055

407 ldaho Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052

3601 Elizabeth Drive Vermilion, Oh 44089

710 712 West Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

35112 Spruce Street North Ridgeville, Oh 44039
4726 Norfolk Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055

730 Washington Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

1890 East 34Th Street Lorain, Oh 44055

418 Caskey Court Oberlin, Oh 44074

1803 Tower Boulevard Lorain, Oh 44053

729 West River Road N Elyria, Oh 44035

1744 Garden Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052

33700 Henwill Road Columbia Station, Oh 44028
536 Appomattox Court Lagrange, Oh 44050

107 Union Street And Vacant Land On The North Side Of W. Herrick Avenue ,

147 Burton Street Avon Lake, Oh 44012

163 And 163 1/2 Jones Street Wellington, Oh 44090
108 Park Street Wellington, Oh 44090
42987 Crestlane Drive Elyria, Oh 44035
4355 Marina Drive Vermilion, Oh 44089

861 Hollywood Drive Elyria, Oh 44035

527 Willow Park Road Elyria, Oh 44035
1218 Hillsdale Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052
4314 Charleston Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055
721 West Martin Avenue Amherst, Oh 44001
336 West 29Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052
246 Warren Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035

244 Oakwood Street Elyria, Oh 44035

Vacant Land 50' X 132' Fka 531 2Nd Street Elyria, Oh 44035

2363-2365 Homewood Drive Lorain, Oh 44055

2329 East 29Th Street Lorain, Oh 44055

3363 Livingston Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055

1921 West 23Rd St., Lorain Oh 44052 02-02-017-108-002 And An Irregular S

114 West 26Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052
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Appraisal Amount

$60,000.00
$60,000.00
$120,000.00
$60,000.00
$84,000.00
$72,000.00
$150,000.00
$63,000.00
$126,000.00
$93,000.00
$39,000.00

$63,000.00
$300,000.00
$30,000.00

$150,000.00

$93,000.00
$36,000.00
$90,000.00
$228,000.00

$54,000.00
$39,000.00
$120,000.00
$33,000.00
$54,000.00
$30,000.00

Sale Price
$40,000.00
$65,281.23

$106,600.00
$40,000.00
$80,000.00
$48,000.00
Cancelled
$42,000.00
$120,800.00
$62,000.00
$26,000.00
No Bid
Cancelled
Cancelled
$20,000.00
$100,100.00
$70,100.00
$43,000.00
$80,000.00
Cancelled
$37,100.00
$38,100.00
$50,000.00
$49,400.00
$80,000.00
$22,000.00
$36,000.00
$20,000.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

03-00-081-103-021
02-00-051-116-002
01-00-003-138-003
06-26-026-000-003
07-00-020-119-053
03-00-077-105-022
06-25-040-101-004
03-00-095-107-019
09-00-087-107-018
02-02-007-109-007
06-24-144-000-002
02-01-003-144-018
11-00-009-102-056
15-00-035-000-075
18-00-028-111-026,
18-00-028-111-028,
18-00-028-111-029
04-00-006-136-010,
04-00-006-136-011
18-00-028-105-002
18-00-027-101-005
06-24-045-102-028
01-00-017-000-109
06-25-028-101-040
06-24-028-105-010
02-02-029-107-022
03-00-078-105-010
05-00-003-103-026
02-01-003-198-014
06-25-015-110-015
10-00-004-124-017,
10-00-004-124-018
06-26-066-000-023
03-00-080-104-018
03-00-082-101-008
02-01-003-228-010
02-02-017-108-002
02-02-017-108-013
02-01-003-188-020



